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Unrequited love is hard enough when you’re a normal teenage girl, but for Lily Sanderson, there’s no such
thing as a simple crush.

Lily has a secret, and it’s not her huge crush on gorgeous swimming god Brody Bennett, who makes her
heart beat flipper-fast. Lily’s mermaid identity is a secret that can’t get out, since she’s not just any
mermaid—she’s a Thalassinian princess. When she discovered three years ago that her mother was actually a
human, Lily finally realized why she didn’t feel quite at home in Thalassinia, and she’s been going to
Seaview High ever since. Living on land has its problems—like her obnoxious biker-boy neighbor, Quince
Fletcher—but it has that one major perk: Brody. The problem is, mermaids aren’t really the casual dating
type—when they bond, it’s for life.

When Lily’s attempt to win Brody’s love leads to a tsunami-sized case of mistaken identity, she finds out,
quick as a tailfin flick, that happily ever after never sails quite as smoothly as you planned.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Bennett:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important usually. The book Forgive My Fins was making you to know about
other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The book
Forgive My Fins is not only giving you considerably more new information but also being your friend when
you truly feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with all the
book Forgive My Fins. You never feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Robert Wilkes:

This Forgive My Fins book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you receive by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get
data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This Forgive My Fins
without we realize teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't
become worry Forgive My Fins can bring if you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves'
become full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Forgive My Fins having very
good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Jeff Keenan:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this Forgive My Fins book as this book
offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct guarantees there is
no doubt in it you may already know.

Beverlee Guthrie:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you know
that little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something by book. Amount
types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims Forgive My Fins.
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